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Fwd: Invoice 21 file corrupt

melissa calice <mrs.calice@gmail.com> Sat, Feb 11, 2012 at 9:47 AM
To: Tony Calice <tony.calice@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message -—---—----

From: melissa calice <mrs.calice@gmail.com>
Date: Sat, Feb 11, 2012 at 9:39 AM

Subject: Re: Inwoice 21 file corrupt

To: Michelle Moccia <mmoccia@onespring.net>

Thank you so much, Michelle. The inwice hootenanny has been weighing heavily on me. | will check it out.

| am glad you like the vase! It is from Pewabic pottery in Detroit.....a really cool, old pottery guild on the once
fashionable Jefferson Ave. Now, it is pretty blighted around the the shop/studio...but Pewabic has held on and is
a bright star in the teetering landscape of Detroit. | have a warm place in my heart for Pewabic. If you are
interested in reading about it | am attaching a link..... http://www.pewabic.org/our-history

Melissa

On Fri, Feb 10, 2012 at 4:43 PM, Michelle Moccia <mmoccia@onespring.net> wrote:

Hi Melissa,
First —thank you for the beautiful green pottery! It looks great in the office.

I just tried to download Invoice 21 and I continue to receive an Adobe error that the file is damaged or
corrupt on two different computers. Will you try to email the invoice to me. I wonder if this Adobe
issue is causing the issues with the Invoice Portal. Have you tried to upload an invoice in either an
Excel or Word format?

Warm regards,

Michelle

Michelle Moccia
Controller and Treasurer
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